## Glenco Corporation

ACKNOWLEDGMENT COPY OF FACTORY ORDER

FACTORY ORDER NO.

FORM P-1017-8-L

212 Durham Avenue, Metuchen, New Jersey · Telephone: Liberty 8-2800 Cable: Gulton-Metuchen · TWX: 499 Metu.

Customer's Order NoDate		Date Ent		Division		Commodity Code C1				
Letter Ju		Julyl	2,1957	Glenco		See Below				
	OFD	Radio Stat PO Box 155 Rutgers Un	ion WRSU			7	Renegotiable Yes No Market District	ACK	NOWLE	OGMENT
	L,	New Brunsw	ick, N.J				erold Department y-Hudanich	V	Ve will ship order on:	your
	HIP O	Same.				officers	Govt, Insp. Req'd. Yes No.	Os shown Date		
Delive	ry Schedule	acks.	e sad netering and a majoral a (sage as ne	Requested Ro	outing	1007-201	Yes No Prepaid Collect		Order Service Corr	) espondent
Govt.	Contract No.	CCAS	Priority	No. Invoices	Ship From		A		. Pt. of Shipment-	NET-10 DAYS
Item	Quantity Ordered	Model or Part No.	ini Arufirmas et monte desifie de	Descript	tion	Te Ne	Unit Price	Balance Due	Quantity Shipped	Total Price
A	100	CBM. 1-3	.l Mfd	500V			\$35.00/c	de emir trops	State scores	
В	50	CBM.05-3	.05 Mf	'd -500V			\$30.00/ <b>E</b>	and	THE THE STATE OF T	
C	100	CBM-01-8	or MP-	600-0-01	-Z .01 l	Mfd	\$10.00/C	Sept and	ANG 90 DA	
D	25	MIN-01	L-Z .11	Ifa 75V			\$40.00/C	and product of the control of the co	clips and to be a tourn on the control of the contr	to the position where the form of the form
E	50	MIN-0-02	2=2 .02	Mfd 75V			\$15°00/c	to which and	er al azidek es	
		Code Numb					me ager and part of the continue of the forest lifted and the forest lifted and the forest lifted and the continue of the cont	dys. Francisco produkteress recommon to the	con to the state of the state o	
		the rained upon the second colors of the second col	Iten	3 C	2 of all values		mine a trigular depolition	org so after y	e kasta Des	
									med class as	
							ry order number sh		TOTAL	

at left. For further information, contact our order service department.

See reverse side for terms and conditions.

### WRSU

630 ON YOUR DIAL

JOHN YACOVELLE '58
Station Manager

BRUCE FISCHER '57
Program Director

GEORGE SCHERER '58
Technical Director

RICHARD F. DAVIS '59
Business Director

Box 155
RUTGERS UNIVERSITY
NEW BRUNSWICK, N. J.
CHarter 9-1052

July 31, 1957

General Radio Supply Co. 600 Penn Street Camden 2, New Jersey Attn.: Industrial Dept.

Dear Sirs:

In a verbal (telephone) order filled last April and May by invoices I 2778, I 1376, and I 92044, we included orders for several items about which we have heard nothing further. We would like to have these i items shipped as soon as possible. They were:

1 Gray equalizer, # 602 C 1 Gray tone arm, xx106xx17x #103 S

1 GE professional cartridge with 2.5 mil sapphire and 1.6 mil diamond styli, # RPX-047 with indicated styli.

We would also like to have the following shipped via parcel post.

Aluminum 19" rack panel, 3\frack width, gray
2 pole, 3 pos. lever switches, CRL # 1454
4 lever switch mounting plates, CRL # P-1759
Aluminum 11 19" rack chassis, 3\frack width

30 Molded paper tubular condensers, .022 mf @ 400v.

Thank you,

George A. Scherer Technical Director

### 5WC 2918-8 END BELLS WITH BEARINGS

CONTACTED PRESTO AS U SUGGESTED AND EY REPLY THAT

EY TO DO NOT HANDLE CYCLOHM PARTS. RENEW REQUEST THAT

TOP AND BOTTOM

U SEND NEND BELL WITH BEARINGS FOR 2 CYCLOHM MOTORS

SWE 2918-87 THESE PARTS URGENTLY NEEDED.

THANK YOU.

J. W.LLIAMS
TECH DIRECTOR

SENT TO

HOWARD INDUSTRIES

ON 12/3/58

4:30 PM

All this is class B

General Radio Supply Co. 600 Fenn Street Camden 2, N. J.

Dear Sirs:

This will confirm our telegrammed order of October 21 for 100 ft. Beldon 8744.

Please send the following:

5 pr. Brush general purpose Earphones, BA-200

6 sets 5' replacement cords for above

6 pr. Rubber earphone cups for above

2 pr. Extra metal headbands for above

(Above items as per quotation of 10 October

#### as inclosed)

lea. Amphenol microphone connector for Electro-Voice microphone Model 623 (I believe the Amphenol number is 91-MCkm)

lea. "Streamliner" desk microphone stand, Atlas model DS-10

l ea. Atlas "Baby Boom" attachment model BB-1

3 ea. Snap action pushbutton switches, Hetherington type Cloo6 SPST (Norm. open)

1 2 ea. Jones barrier strips, No. 18-140

Thank you very much.

Very truly yours,

David G. Ressler

November 17, 1958

Lafayetto Radio 165-08 Liberty Avenue Jamaica 35, N. Y.

Dear sire:

In anticipation of a quantity order, please send:

1 ca. No. SN-20 3-position telephone type switch.....net: \$0.69

We denistiable prompt delivery so that we may begin testing. Thank you very mich.

Very truly yours,

David G. Ressler

General Radio Supply Co. 600 Penn St. Camden 2, N. J.

Dear Sirs:

We would like to order the following item:



l ea. Cannon Plug, Type SK-M7-21C-1 plug (with socket insert.

Thank you very much.

Very truly yours,

David Ressler

October 29, 1958

Mr. Phillip R. White The Bulletin Riverdale, N. J.

Dear Phil,

Please run off a thousand sheets of WRSU stationery like the ones before. If possible please separate the cut and the writing just a little nore. Also, take fifty out and print the following name in the upper left hand corner as before:

> RICHARD BATT Business Director

> > Simcerely, Dave Resolut

November 4, 1958

Ampex Corporation 934 Charter Street Redwood City, California

Dear Sirs:

Please send the following:

l ea. Power cable, No. CS-5, for Ampex Model 601, Serial No. 7D 245.

Thank you very much.

Sincerely,

David Ressler





Station Manager . . . Don Malpass
Program Director . . . Lynne Warnick
Technical Director . . . George Scherer
Business Director . . . Richard Davis

Box 155

Rutgers University

New Brunswick

New Jersey

February 7, 1958

William Radio Supply Company 265 Woodbridge Avenue New Brunswick New Jersey

Dear Sir:

The technical department of WRSU, the Rutgers University radio station, needs several new cannon connectors:

four (4) of type P-CGQ11S

cord-plug combination

steel and zinc (with socket insert)

3 poles, capacity 30 amps.

cat. #P-3-CG-11S

and three (3) of type P-CG-12S

cord-plug combination

steel and zince(with pin insert)

3 contact, capacity 30 amps.

cat. #P3-CG-12S

Could we please have your bid on cannon connectors of that type? I look forward to your reply.

Very sincerely yours,

Technical Director

FN:fn





Station Manager . . . Don Malpass
Program Director . . Lynne Warnick
Technical Director . . . George Scherer
Business Director . . . Richard Davis

Box 155

Rutgers University

**New Brunswick** 

**New Jersey** 

February 25, 1958

General Radio Supply Company 6CO Penn Street Camden New Jersey

Dear Sir:

As technical director for WRSU, the radio station of Rutgers, the State University, I would like to order the following Registors for Stock:

Amount	Wattage	v.
1	1	15 22 33 47 56 82 10 100 120 150 180 270
11425353535454111662112111113	/2	33
2		56
5		82
3		100
3		120
3		150
h		270
5		330
1		1000
i		330 1000 1500 1800 6800 8200
ļ	and the state of t	6800
6		22K
2		39K 68K 82K
1		68K
2		.12M
1		.18M
i		.50M
1		.82M
		2.7M
3		82K .12M .18M .56M .69M .82M 2.7M 5.6M 6.8M

The bill should be made out to WRSU. I look forward to a prompt delivery.

Sincerely,

Sold To: WRSU - Radio Rutgers
Box 155 - Rutgers
New Brunswick, N. J.

CHarter 9 - 1052

Shin To: WRSII - Redin Rutgare

Purchase Order No. 1133

Date December 18, 1959

Quan.	Manufacturer	Mfr. No.	Description
	er year ye disomulik in mekesir. And to fize an unopur silkert trebe distalling biodes in editoreta ye and year down he seemed		Paper
<del>-1 00.</del>		**************************************	Capacitor, .2 MFD, 1200 VOLTS
l ea.	Potter & Brumfield	ка5ау	6 valt AC Relay, SPDT
			The former of the beautiful and
	The state of the s		
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
		· 2000年 日 1000年 日 100	

SHIP TO: W.R.S.U.

12 College Avenue
New Brunswick, New Jersey

DATE

December 1. 1959

NAME	General Radio Corp. DESCRIPTION	MANUFACTURER'S NUMBER	QUANTI:
Relay	Delay, 1 min., NO	Amperite No. 115N060	l ea.
Tube socket	Breadboard-mounting	octal socket for above, any make	l ea.
		David G. Ressler Station Manager	

# This is a BID

### To Get The Correct Price Refer To This Number

5752

DATE Nov. 3, 1959

NO. 1-10

Radio Shack Corporation, 730 Commonwealth Ave., Boston, Mass.

HE FOLLOWING

PARTS FOR THE QUANTITIES SHOWN BELOW. THIS IS NOT AN

ORDER .

PRICE, AVAILABILITY

5 Replacement transformer for Sylvania part no.
55-83618-1

Plate voltage- 600 volts CT @ 300 ma
Rectifier- 5 volts
Filaments- #1 6.3 v @ 12 a; #2- 6.3 v @ 1.25 a

10 10 micro-farad 600 VDC Pyranol Capacitors

3.30

ALL PARTS MUST BE NEW AND UNUSED OR NEW AND UNUSED GOVERNMENT SURPLUS

#### REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

REPLY TO: WESU

TECHNICAL DEPT.

BOX 155

RUTGERS UNLVERSITY NEW BRUNSWICK, N. J.

DATE Nov. 3, 1959

NO.

1-10

PLEASE ADVISE PRICE AND AVAILABILITY OF THE FOLLOWING PARTS FOR THE QUANTITIES SHOWN BELOW. THIS IS NOT AN

ORDER a

PART NO. AND DESCRIPTION QUANTITY 5 Replacement transformer for Sylvania part no. 55-83618-1 Plate voltage- 600 volts CT @ 300 ma Rectifier- 5 volts Filaments- #1 6.3 v @ 12 a; #2- 6.3 v @ 1.25 a Special Connat Au 10 micro-farad 600 VDC Pyranol Capacitors 10 CD 710- 6100 Cord ALL PARTS MUST BE NEW AND UNUSED OR NEW AND

UNUSED GOVERNMENT SURPLUS

bev. 2, 1953

l box (10 ea)

WOU 8560

Bulbs

P.O. 1129 Nov 2,59

RCA No. 14

	1100 2, 39	
Tape head	Magnecorder Record-reproduce heads for	2 ea.
	PT6 Recorder, Magnecorder No. 91A57	
Tone Arm	General Electric Model TM-2G	l ea.
Recording Tape	Audio Devices Inc. Audiotape type 1251	2 ea. 600 ft reels
Tape Reels	Empty 5-inch tape reels	6 ea.
VU Meter	Triplett, Case No. 327-T for 600 ohm line, illuminated, volume unit	l ea.

James A. wWilliams Technical Director

212 Durham Avenue, Metuchen, New Jersey • Telephone: Liberty 8-2800

Nov. 6, 1959

WRSU
Technical Dept.
Box 155
Rutgers University
New Brunswick, N. J.

Reference:

1 - 10

Subject:

Replacement transformer & Pyranol Capacitors

Gentlemen:

Thank you very much for your referenced request.

Since we are not currently producing items which meet these specifications, we are unable to supply you with the information you desire.

If you have any further questions, please do not hesitate to contact our representative in your area, as listed below.

We would appreciate it very much if you would retain our name on your bidder's mailing list for future requirements.

Very truly yours,

GULTON INDUSTRIES, INC.

Edward A. Cohen Sales Manager

EAC:mjw

rep: Hy Abrams

6 Rutgers Rd. Cranford, N. J.

#### REQUEST FOR QUOTATION

REPLY TO: WESU

DATE Nov. 3, 1959

TECHNICAL DEPT.

BOX 155 RUTGERS UNIVERSITY NEW BRUNSWICK, N. J.

No. 1-10

PLEASE ADVISE PRICE AND AVAILABILITY OF THE FOLLOWING PARTS FOR THE QUANTITIES SHOWN BELOW. THIS IS NOT AN ORDER.

WILLIAM RADIO

ANTITY	PART NO. AND DESCRIPTION	PRICE, AVAILABILITY
5	Replacement transformer for Sylvania part no. 55-83618-1 Plate voltage- 600 Volts CT @ 300 ma	Thordaron 76 17 92
	Rectifier- 5 Volts Filaments- #1- 6.3V @ 12a; #2- 6.3V @ 1.25a	16 25 la
10	10 micro-farad 600 VDC Pyranol Capacitors	2.20 earl
	ALL PARTS MUST BE NEW AND UNUSED OR NEW AND	

UNUSED GOVERNMENT SURPLUS

7367

WOODLAWN
4-8383
4-8393
PHILA. PHONE
WALNUT 2-7037

### ZENERAL RADIO

WHOLESALE DISTRIBUTORS OF TELEVISION • RADIO • ELECTRONIC PARTS & EQUIPMENT

600 PENN STREET • CAMPEN 2 • NEW JERSEY

DATE SUBMITTED 11-3-59

TO . WRSU

Technical Dept. Box 155

· Rutgers University

New Brunswick, N. J.

TERMS: 24420 F.O.B. SHIPPING POINT

Prices shown do not include Transportation Charges nor any Sale, Excise or other Government charge payable by the Seller to Federal, State, or Local Authority. Any such taxes now or hereafter imposed upon sales or shipments under the terms hereof will be added to said Purchase Price and Buyer agrees to reimburse Seller for any such tax. Seller is not to be accountable for delays in delivery if caused by any legislature, administrative or executive law, order or regulation of the Federal Government or any State or Municipal Government or any subdivision, department, agency, officer or official thereof, or if caused by strikes, fire, flood, delay of carrier, inability to obtain suitable labor, and necessary supplies of raw materials, or other unavoidable contingencies beyond Seller's control. This quotation is rendered on condition of the Buyer's acceptance within fifteen days from the date submitted.

QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	PRICE
	No. 1-10	
5	Replacement transformer for Sylvania part no. 55-83618-1	no bid
	Plate voltage-600 volts CT @ 300 ma Rectifier- 5 volts Filaments- #1- 6.3V @ 12a; #2- 6.3V @ 1.25a	
10	10 micro-farad 600VDC Pyranol Capacitors	no bid
_		
		1-
	Respectfully Submitted by	

GEN

GENERAL RADIO SUPPLY CO.

ORIGINAL COPY OF QUOTATION

#### HERBERT WEINTRAUB

REPLY TO: WE

Ti dC wo

TERMINAL RADIO CORPORATION 85 CORTLANDT STREET NEW YORK 7, N. Y. ME Nov. 3, 1959

₫( WORTH 4-3311

NEW BRUNSWICK, No Jo

NO. 1-10

PLEASE ADVISE PRICE AND AVAILABILITY OF THE FOLLOWING PARTS FOR THE QUANTITIES SHOWN BELOW. THIS IS NOT AN ORDER.

MITTY	PART NO. AND DESCRIPTION	PRICE, AVAILABILITY
5	Replacement transformer for Sylvania part no. 55-83618-1  Plate voltage- 600 Volts CT @ 300 ma  Rectifier- 5 Volts  Filaments- #1 6.3V @ 12A; #2- 6.3V @ 1.25 A	NO-BID
10	10 micro-farad 600 VDC Pyranol Capacitors	606
	ALL PARTS MUST BE NEW AND UNUSED OR NEW AND UNUSED GOVERNMENT SURPLUS	

H' Weintraul Terminal Radio 11/10/59

#### QUOTATION

#### MILO ELECTRONICS CORPORATION

530 CANAL STREET NEW YORK 13, N. Y.

**BEEKMAN 3-2980** 

WRSU Technical Dept. Box 155 Rutgers University New Brunswick, N,J. BID DATE 11/4/59 TERMS 2% 10/days F.O.B. Our warehouse N.Y.C. DELIVERY STOCK

REF. NO. 1-10

THE FOLLOWING IS OUR FORMAL QUOTATION ON MATERIAL AS LISTED:

Plate voltage-600 volts ct at 300 ma Recitfier-5 volts Filaments- #1- 6.3 volts at 12 a; #2-6.3 at 1.25 a.  10 lo micro-farad 600 VDC Pyranol Capacitors AEROVOX JP09 10 mfd600V quote item new- not surplus  Plate voltage-600 volts ct at 300 ma Recitfier-5 volts Filaments- #1- 6.3 volts at 12 a; #2-6.3 at 1.25 a.	UNIT PRICE TOTAL
Recitfier-5 volts Filaments- #1- 6.3 volts at 12 a; #2-6.3 at 1.25 a.  10 lo micro-farad 600 VDC Pyranol Capacitors AEROVOX JP09 10 mfd600 V quote item new- not surplus  MILO ELECTRONICS CORP.  530 Canal Street • N. Y. • BE 3-2980  FILE #/L/59 23607	no bid
AEROVOX JP09 10 mfd600V quote item new- not surplus  MILO ELECTRONICS CORP.  530 Canal Street • N. Y. • BE 3-2980  FILE #/4/59 23607	
530 Canal Street N. Y. • BE 3-2980  FILE ### 23607	+.64 net ea. ess brackets rackets if desire t.15 ea. brocket.
PLEASE NOTE:	
file number. When you order, to facilitate prompt and efficient processing, please affix the file number sticker below to your purchase order.	
MILO ELECTRONICS CORP.  530 Canal Street • N. Y. • BE 3-2980  FILE #  REQUEST #1-10  FOR QUICKEST PROCESSING, PLEASE AFFIX THIS FILE NUMBER STICKER TO YOUR PURCHASE ORDER.	

MILO ELECTRONICS CORPORATION

Oscar Smith ALL PRICES AS SHOWN REMAIN FIRM FOR.

7

TO: American Elite, Inc. 48-50 34th Street Long Island City, New York

No. 4119

From: W.R.S.U. 12 College Ave. New Brunswick, New Jersey

REPAIR ORDER

lea. Telefunken M410 0 200 ohm Nr1682 Microphone to be repaired and have general maintenance performed as necessary.

PACKING LIST

W.R.S.U.

12 College Ave.

New Brunswick, N.J.

Shipped To: American Elite Long Island City, New York

W.R.S.U. Purchase No. 4119

i ea Telefunken M410 0 200 ohm Nr1682 Microphone

To be repaired and have general maintenance performed as necessary.

1 ctn. 11b. Shipped Parcel Post 4/13/59

FROM	FROM
AMERICAN ELITE, INC. 48-50 34th STREET • LONG ISLAND CITY I, N. Y.	AMERICAN ELITE, INC. 48-50 34th STREET • LONG ISLAND CITY I, N. Y.
POSTMASTER: CONTENTS—MERCHANDISE. THIS PARCEL MAY BE OPENED FOR POSTAL INSPECTION IF NECESSARY. RETURN POSTAGE GUARANTEED.	POSTMASTER: CONTENTS — MERCHANDISE THIS PARCEL MAY BE OPENED FOR POSTAL INSPECTION IF NECESSARY. RETURN POSTAGE GUARANTEED.
W.S.R.U. 12 College Ave. New Brunswick, New Jersey	ТО

YOUR ORDER NO. DATE OF ORDER OUR ORDER NO. VIA TERMS SALESMAN G.O.D. 5-11-59 969 QUANTITY DESCRIPTION LIST PRICE UNIT PRICE AMOUNT Repair # 846 M410 strophone in exchange ser.# 4059 net

NOTE: This shipment was carefully checked and shipped in perfect condition. In case of damage or shortage file claim with the carrier, immediately obtaining from them an inspection report. We will be pleased to assist you in the pursuance of your claim.

Sent # 11:00 AM Posts onderd on 3/1/59 registed. Sort surplus tubes offer ordered 2/7/59 rejected and being returned parcel post. Parts are not new a unused. Regret unovoidable delay since receipt of material Thank you I Hilliams WRSV-Rutger Radio Station Parts shipped 3/20/59 C. W. ELECTRONICS CHICAGO

Letter sent 2/7/59
Parts rejected on 3/11/59

R. W. Electronics

2430 S. Michigan Avenue
Chicago 16, Illinois

#### Dear Sirs:

In reference to your offering of government surplus electronic tubes in Bulletin No. 25, please send the following:

Quantity	Quantity	Quantity
6041	6AC77	6AG7.*
6J61	6SJ73	6SN710
12461	6SK72	12AT7.3
12SJ7.3	6v6gr.5	12AU7.4
2.75	VR150.3	12AU7.4 11.00

Please ship via Parcel Post.

Thank you.

11.00 9.00 2.75 22.75 + Parul Post Sincerely,

James Williams

Technical Director